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2008 Yearling Fillies 

 
 
Siensational Dream (NW Siensational x RA Dreammweaver by Padrons Psyche) 2008 
Bay Filly 
 $15,000 
 
Biankkha Z  (Odyssey SC x SH Crown Jewel by DWD Tabasco) 2008 Grey Filly sired 
by Multi National Champion Odyssey. Of the 160 registered Odyssey get, Biankkha is 1 
of only 8 grey Odyssey daughters. She is a rarity and won’t be around long! She is 
sweepstakes nominated and is in the US halter futurities program. 
 
Adrihanna Z  (Odyssey SC x Destines Chance by CWP Chances Are) 2008 Bay Filly 
sired by Multi National Champion Odyssey and out of a Chances Are daughter. She has a 
beautiful head, long neck and great topline! She will make a great halter horse or 
broodmare. She is sweepstakes nominated and is in the US halter futurities program. 
 
Loredonna Z  (Odyssey SC x Lily Marlaina by Thee Infidel) 2008 Black Bay Filly sired 
by Multi National Champion Odyssey and out of a Thee Infidel daughter, which is out of 
a Probat daughter who is also an Aristocrat mare. Loredonna’s dam was recently 
purchased by Roxanne Hart of Rohara Arabians. She is sure to catch your eye! She is 
sweepstakes nominated and is in the US halter futurities program. Loredonna is also 
entered in the Scottsdale Signature Stallion program and entered in the Scottsdale Show 
this year to be shown in the Signature ATH class! 
 
Jazelle Z  (Odyssey SC x Darling Lili by Fairview Klassique) 2008 Bay Filly sired by 
Multi National Champion Odyssey and out of a mare sired by National Champion 
Fairview Klassique who is out of a Probat daughter! Jazelle’s dam, Darlng Lili, has only 
3 foals including Jazelle and one of them is already a Regional Champion in halter! 
Jazelle is sweepstakes nominated and is in the US halter futurities program. Jazelle is also 
entered in the Scottsdale Signature Stallion program and entered in the Scottsdale Show 
this year to be shown in the Signature ATH class! 
 
Nausicaa MAJ (Odyssey SC x Dinamaj)  2008 Bay Filly sired by Multi National 
Champion Odyssey! Her dam, Dinamaj, is also the dam of Regional Champion & World 
Cup Reserve Champion Stallion Hukam MAJ, as well as, multi Regional Champion mare 
Penelope MAJ. Nausicaa is sweepstakes nominated and is in the US & Canada halter 
futurities program. She is also entered in the Scottsdale Show this year to be shown in the 
Open Fillies class! 
 
 



Emmilee  (ML Flamboyant x MP Emma by Mark of Fame) 2008 Bay Filly. Sired by the 
outstanding halter and performance champion ML Flamboyant+.  Champions producing 
champions in every line of her pedigree including Huckleberry Bey, Bey Shah, Fame 
VF+, Mark of Fame & Monogramm. This beautiful filly is nominated for Breeders 
Sweepstakes, Scottsdale Signature Stallion and Silver Sire Futurities.   
 
 

2 Year Old Fillies 
 
Simply Siensational  (NW Siensational x Maggie Mae PGA by Magnum Psyche) 2007 
Grey Filly 
 $75,000 
 
Julianna Z  (TF Psymreekhe x Mysandra VF by Pallisandre) 2007 Bay Filly sired by 
National Champion TF Psymreekhe and out a mare with lines to greats like Bey Shah+, 
Khemosabi++++// and *Muscat! Julianna’s dam, Mysandra VF, whose dam is My 
Mavica was sired by *Muscat. My Mavica is also the dam of National Champion Encore 
Ali which is the sire of Regal Actor JP, the sire of the 2008 Reserve Canadian National 
Champion Stallion Bey Ambition and 2008 Supreme Champion World Cup Champion 
Stallion Arbiteur! Julianna is entered in the 2 Year Old Fillies Open Class and the 
AAOTH 2 Year Old Fillies Class. Julianna is sweepstakes nominated and is in the US & 
Canada halter futurities program. 
 

3 Year Old Mares 
 
Rosalie Van Ryad  (Rashid Van Ryad x Rosebud SS) 2006 Chestnut Mare sired by 
Reserve National Champion Stallion Rashid Van Ryad. Rosalie is a great broodmare 
prospect. 
 
Dina Mite SA  (Pryme Thyme x Chance to Dazzle by CWP Chances Are) 2006 Grey 
Mare, very pretty with great motion. Entered in Scottsdale in the Open and Amateur.  
 

4 Year Old Mares 
 
Marwans Amira MF  (Marwan Al Shaqab x Alada Ladeeda MF) 2005 Grey Mare by 
National & International Champion Marwan Al Shaqab. She is open for the 2009 
breeding season. Amira is one of only a handful of grey Marwan daughters left in the US! 
 
Shania RS  (MPA Giovanni x BM Shanahra) 2005 Chestnut Mare sired by National 
Champion MPA Giovanni. Beautiful headed mare who is sure to produce typey babies! 
 

 
 
 



5 Year Old Mares 
 

Penelope MAJ  (Odyssey SC x Dinamaj)  2004 Bay Mare sired by Multi National 
Champion Odyssey. Penelope is a multi Regional Champion mare in halter and sells with 
the 2009 Minnesota Auction breeding to GH Maryn. Penelope can be viewed at Shada 
Arabians until the Marketplace event by calling Jerry Schall at 612-865-9202. 
 
Z Victoria  (Consensus x Forevermore T by Fortunado) 2004 Grey Mare 
 $40,000 
 
Impressivves Beauty  (Impressive (Echo Magnifficoo) x TF Falcons Beauty by Falcon 
BHF) 2004 Grey Mare 
          $20,000 
 

6 Year Old Mares 
 
KO Shimering Star  (El Nahr HCF x Satinsherie Amor by All The More)  2003 
Chestnut Mare in foal to Multi National Champion Odyssey SC! This foal is the 2010 
Auction foal for Scottsdale!  $35,000 
 
Evian CSP  (Mamage x Avalonprarierose by Huckleberry Bey++) 2003 Bay mare 
 $15,000 
 

7 Year Old Mares 
 
Sace  (Versace x China Bey SF by Bey Shah+) 2002 Bay Mare sired by the legendary 
stallion Versace. Sace is SCID clear. 
 Private Treaty 
 
Maggie Mae PG  (Magnum Psyche x Rachael Ann by Bey Shah+) 2002 Grey Mare 
 Private Treaty 
 
RA Dreammweaver  (Padrons Psyche x Aloha Famespinner by Fame VF) 2002 Bay 
Mare 
 $35,000 
 
Piri of Glencoe  (Alada Baskin I x Khalendar Girl by Khemosabi++++//) 2002 Black 
Mare in foal to Multi National Champion Odyssey for a 2009 foal. The in-utero foal is 
sweepstakes nominated and is in the US halter futurities program. 

 
 
 
 



8 & Older Mares 
 
OA Kovenant  (Gual Kubesi x JB Jabasks Dor by GG Jabask+/) 1998 Chestnut Mare 
 $9,000 
 
WC Summer Star  (Autumn Blaze v X Nadza) 1999 Bay Mare, very versatile and can 
be shown in halter and performance (Country Pleasure). Amateur and kid ready and she 
is Breeders Sweepstakes nominated . Showing in Liberty at Scottsdale. 
 

 
 

2008 Yearling Colts 
 
RA Eros  (NW Siensational x Evian CSP by Mamage) 2008 Bay Colt 
 $8,000 
 
Roman Z  (Odyssey SC x LF Magnitude by Magnum Psyche) 2008 Chestnut Colt sired 
by Multi National Champion Odyssey and out of a Magnum Psyche daughter. Great 
length of neck and leg and should do very well in the new halter scoring system. The 1st 
baby born on the Gemini Ranch farm by Odyssey in 2008 and Roman is just full of 
himself. Roman is entered in the Yearling Colts Open Class in Scottsdale. He is 
sweepstakes nominated and in the US futurities. 
 
Tristan Z  (Odyssey SC x Kalila VF by Psymadre) 2008 Bay Colt sired by Multi 
National Champion Odyssey and out of a Psymadre daughter. Tristan is sweepstakes 
nominated and is in the US halter futurities program. He is also entered in the Scottsdale 
Signature Stallion 
program and entered in the Scottsdale Show this year to be shown in the Signature ATH 
class! 
 
Batistta Z  (Odyssey SC x WR Allada Joy by Allionce+/) 2008 Bay Colt sired by Multi 
National Champion Odyssey and out of an Allionce+/ daughter who is out of the 
*Bask++ daughter Aklaime. He is sweepstakes nominated and is in the US halter 
futurities program. Batistta is also entered in the Scottsdale Signature Stallion program 
and entered in the Scottsdale Show this year to be shown in the Signature ATH class! 
 
Gemini of Glencoe  (Odyssey SC x Piri of Glencoe by Alada Baskin I)  2008 Bay Colt 
sired by Multi National Champion Odyssey and out of an Alada Baskin I daughter who is 
out of a Khemosabi++++// daughter that is in this sale. He is sweepstakes nominated and 
is in the US halter futurities program. Gemini is also entered in the Scottsdale Signature 
Stallion program and entered in the Scottsdale Show this year to be shown in the 
Signature ATH class! 
 
 



PS Mystic Odyssey  (Odyssey SC x PS Rose Mahogany by Padrons Mahogany) 2008 
Chestnut Colt sired by Multi National Champion Odyssey. Mystic’s dam, PS Rose 
Mahogany, is the Dam of Scottsdale Champion filly PS Rose of Marwan and Regional 
Champion Filly PS Desert Rose. He is sweepstakes nominated and is in the US & Canada 
halter futurities program. Mystic is also entered in the Scottsdale Signature Stallion 
program and the Nor Cal futurity and is also entered in the Scottsdale Show this year to 
be shown in the Signature ATH class, as well as, the Yearling Open Colts! 
 
Armageddon  (Fausto x SB Fantasy Bey by ZT Shak Fantasy) 2008 Chestnut Colt sired 
by Brazilian National Champion Fausto! Sweepstakes nominated, US and Canadian 
futurities, Iowa Gold Star and Minnesota Medallion nominated. Entered at Scottsdale in 
Signature Yearling Colts and in the Open Yearling Class. 
 
Big Thyme SA (Pryme Thyme x Diamond Tribute) 2008 Black Purebred Arabian Colt 
who is a 3/4 brother to National Champion Pyro Thyme. US futurities nominated. 
Entered in Scottsdale in Open and Amateur. 
 

 
2 Year Old Colts 

 
My Jullyen  (Jullyen el Jamaal x Bint Anastazzia by Thee Desperado) 2007 Bay Colt. 
 Private Treaty 
 
Drago Z  (Dakar El Jamaal x FOF Kharolina by Padrons Psyche) 2007 Grey Colt sired 
by National Champion Dakar El Jamaal. Drago Z is the only full brother to International 
Champion and US National Reserve Champion Stallion Dakharo. Drago is in the 
sweepstakes program and is in the US & Canada futurities. He has a very bright future in 
the halter show ring as well as in someone’s breeding program! 
 
Mmonsignor  (Justify x Liza Monelli by Monogramm) 2007 Chestnut Colt sired by 
Justify and out of a Monogramm daughter. Mmonsignor is by far the best Justify son to 
date. He has won over $50,000.00 in prize money in 2008 and his future looks very 
bright. He was the 2008 Scottsdale Reserve Champion Auction Colt, 2008 Minnesota 
Medallion Stallion Auction Champion Colt & the 2008 Minnesota Medallion Stallion 
Champion Yearling Colt. He is sweepstakes nominated and is in the  US & Canada 
futurities. He is also in the Scottsdale Signature Program and is entered to show in the 2 
Year Old Signature ATH Class.  
 

Geldings 
 
Mister Razzle Dazzle  (ML Flamboyant x Rohara Mara) 2007 Chestnut Gelding 
 $20,000 
 
PS Dark Odyssey  (Odyssey SC x PS Patina by Padrons Mahogany) 2004 Bay Gelding 
sired by Multi National Champion Odyssey. He is a Regional Champion in halter and  



was also the 2008 Reserve Champion Gelding at the Las Vegas World Cup Show. PS 
Dark Odyssey is sure to take you to the winners circle, as he is a proven winner! He is 
now started under saddle and has a great show attitude! 
 
MC Nautilus  (Enzo x  MC Khardia by Kharben++/) 2004 Chestnut Gelding 
 $50,000 
 
TFA Montero Bey  (Hucks Reflection V+  x TFA Katrina by Aladdinn Echo) 1999 Bay 
Gelding 
 $30,000 
 

Half Arabians 
 
 TF Arrogance Elegance  (Arrogance AA x QR Stage Bells (AQHA)) 2001 Bay Mare 
 $15,000 
 
PKH Miss Elegant Fame  (The Color of Fame x PL Darque Satin by Tel Arish) 2000 
Bay Tabiano Mare  $8,000 
 
CSP Vincent Vega  (Vega x Vanities Gal) 2008 Half Arabian Colt with the same Dam of 
Multi National Champion Half Arabian English horse Second Editions Debut and James 
Dean. Sired by 2 time Pure Bred English National Champion Vega. Nice chestnut half 
Arabian with great motion and upright neck. Showing in Saddle Pleasure Type Yearling 
Geldings Amateur at Scottsdale.. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 


